

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

San Antonio Belting & Pulley
 2111 W. Cevallos
 San Antonio, TX 78204

Austin Distributing
 5344 Rittiman Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78218

River City Hydraulics, Inc.

Taylor Made Hose

A.	HYDRAULIC HOSES (To include 1,2, AII, and 4 Wire Spiral)				
1.	Catalog Price Discount Manufacturer		Aeroquip	Gates	
2.	Discount off price list		67%	1,2,AII,4 x .50%	
3.	Price list identification		Aeroquip Price List 2014	35096-00	
4.	Effective date of price list		Oct. 2014	Feb. 1, 2015	
5.	Column of price list on which discount is based (I.e., wholesale, jobber, retail)		Retail	List Price	
B.	HYDRAULIC HOSE FITTINGS, FERRULES, COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS				
1.	Catalog Price Discount Manufacturer		Aeroquip	Gates	
2.	Discount off price list		Adapters 61% Fittings 63%	x.50%	
3.	Price list identification		Aeroquip Price List 2014	35096-00	
4.	Effective date of price list		Oct. 2014	Feb. 1, 2015	
5.	Column of price list on which discount is based (I.e., wholesale, jobber, retail)		Retail	List Price	
C.	MISCELLANEOUS O RINGS, SEALS AND CYLINDER KITS	MFG LIST PRICE	APG x.90	Hercules x.52	
D.	HYDRAULIC QUICK COUPLERS RANGING FROM 1/4 INCH TO 1 1/4 INCH	MFG LIST PRICE	Dixon x.55	Stucchi x.58	
E.	PRESSURE GUAGES RANGING FROM VACUUM TO PSI 10,000	MFG LIST PRICE	Dixon x.55	Dynamic x.60	
F.	BALL VALVES RANGING FROM 500 TO 7500 PSI	MFR. MFG LIST PRICE	Dixon/Anchor	Apollo & Anchor	

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

San Antonio Belting & Pulley
 2111 W. Cevallos
 San Antonio, TX 78204

Austin Distributing
 5344 Rittiman Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78218

River City Hydraulics, Inc.

Taylor Made Hose

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	PRICE	San Antonio Belting & Pulley 2111 W. Cevallos San Antonio, TX 78204	Austin Distributing 5344 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	River City Hydraulics, Inc.	Taylor Made Hose
	500 TO 2000 PSI LIST PRICE MULTIPLIER	PRICE	x.55	x.80		
	2000 TO 7500 PSI LIST PRICE MULTIPLIER	PRICE	x.55	x.57		
	10 ea. Valve Ball 1 IN 5075 PSI, SAWS #17059	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	81.60 816.00 Anchor AE2N1-11DB	74.9778 749.78 Anchor AE2N1-11DB		
	12 ea. Valve Ball 1/2 IN 2000 PSI Carbon Steel, SAWS #17093	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	30.57 366.84 Anchor AE2N 1/2 -11DB	22.84 274.08 Apollo 73A-103-01A		
	12 ea. Valve Ball 1/2 IN 7250 PSI, SAWS #17062	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	30.57 366.84 Anchor AE2N 1	34.0575 408.69 Anchor AE2N1/2-11DB		
	8 ea. Valve Ball 3/4 IN 5800 PSI, SAWS #32451	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	47.87 382.96 Anchor AE2N3/4-11DB	58.8297 470.64 Anchor AE2N3/4-11DB		
	10 ea. Valve Ball 1/2 IN 2000 PSI Carbon SS, SAWS #17093	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	29.13 291.30 Dixon IBV50	22.84 228.40 Apollo 73A-103-01A		
	TOTAL	TOTAL	2,223.94	2,131.59		
G.	AIR HOSES PSI 500 (except as noted)	PRICE	1.82	1.8916	NO BID	NO BID
	400 ft. 3/8 IN-AIR HOSE, SAWS #25872	TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	728.00 Thermoid Hercules	756.64 Goodyear 3/8 Gorilla		
	100 ft. 1/2 IN-AIR HOSE, SAWS #25373	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	2.49 249.00 Thermoid Hercules	2.7022 270.22 Goodyear 1/2 Gorilla		
	100 ft. 3/4 IN-AIR HOSE, SAWS #25874	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	3.26 326.00 Thermoid Hercules	3.6414 364.14 Goodyear 3/4 Gorilla		
	40 ea. 3/4 IN ID AIR HOSE PREMOFLEX 50 FT LONG JACK HAMMER ASSEMBLY PSI 300 SAWS #13140	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	68.38 2,735.20 Thermoid Hercules	87.3008 3,492.03 Goodyear ASY-3/4-Wing-AM6-50ft		
	TOTAL GROUP G	TOTAL	4,038.20	4,883.03		
H.	AIR COUPLERS	PRICE	0.90	0.7656		
	200 ea. 727 M Style, SAWS #25875	TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	180.00 Dixon DCP21	153.12 Milton 727		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

San Antonio Belting & Pulley
 2111 W. Cevallos
 San Antonio, TX 78204

Austin Distributing
 5344 Rittiman Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78218

River City Hydraulics, Inc.

Taylor Made Hose

	50 ea. 728 M Style Female Thread 1/4 IN, SAWS #25878	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	0.93 46.50 Dixon DCP21	0.8118 40.59 Milton 728	NO BID	NO BID
	10 ea. 153 Standard Blow Gun, SAWS #25879	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	9.20 92.00 Dixon D204-30	17.5004 175.00 Milton 158		
	50 ea. 715 1/4 IN NPT Female Thread, SAWS #25880	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	3.66 183.00 Dixon DC20	3.5112 175.56 Milton 715		
	25 ea. 1144 Mini Air Line Filters, SAWS #25881	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	7.69 192.25 Milton 1144-1	5.7001 142.50 Milton 1144-1		
	TOTAL GROUP H	TOTAL	693.75	686.78		
I.	CLEAR BRAIDED TUBING	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	0.50 25.00 Kuriyama K3150-06	0.5215 26.08 Kuriyama K3150-06		
	50 ft. K3150-06 3/8", SAWS #25892	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	0.90 270.00 Kuriyama K3150-10	0.7528 225.84 Kuriyama K3150-10		
	300 ft. K3150-06 5/8", SAWS #16895	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	1.64 82.00 Kuriyama K3150-16	1.6969 84.85 Kuriyama K3150-16		
	50 ft. K3150-16 1", SAWS #25896	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE				
	TOTAL GROUP I	TOTAL	377.00	336.76		
J.	TANK HOSE	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	7.47 373.50 Kuriyama T605	12.162 608.10 Goodyear GY21/2-Flexwing		
	50 ft. Tank Hose 2 1/2" Rubber w/wire helix, SAWS #25897	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE				
	TOTAL GROUP J	TOTAL	373.50	608.10		
K.	DISCHARGE HOSES (LAY FLAT STANDARD DUTY)	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	78.23 391.15 Kuriyama BD1002EC	71.5496 357.75 Goodyear ASY-2-SRIRA-Blue-C-E-100FT		
	5 ea. Discharge Hose 2 IN x 50 FT w/male & female camlocks, SAWS #13144	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	99.79 498.95 Kuriyama BD504EC	131.9378 659.69 Goodyear ASY-4-SPIRA-BLUE-C-E-50FT-BAND		
	5 ea. Discharge Hose 4 IN x 50 FT Blue w/male & female camlocks punch lok and band it, SAWS #25899	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE	187.14 935.70 Kuriyama BD504EC	200.2799 1,001.40 Goodyear ASY-6-SPIRA-BLUE-C-E-50FT		
	5 ea. Discharge Hose 6 IN x 50 FT Blue w/male & female camlocks punch lok and band it, SAWS #25900	PRICE TOTAL MFG.STK MFG.HOSE				

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

		PRICE	173.71	187.1030	River City Hydraulics, Inc.	Taylor Made Hose
		TOTAL	19,108.10	20,581.33		
	5 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Goodyear		
	Discharge Hose 3 IN x 50 FT Red Layflat 275 HSA3, SAWS #34880	MFG.HOSE	IS503BS	ASY-3-RED-Layflat-275HSA3 SET-50FT		
	TOTAL GROUP K	TOTAL	20,933.90	22,600.17		
L.	VACUUM HOSES	PRICE	15.34	26.98		
		TOTAL	30.68	53.96		
	2 ea.	MFG.STK	Flexhaust	Flexhaust		
	Vacuum Hose 1 1/2 inches 4 feet assembly PVC w/end cuffs, SAWS #13176	MFG.HOSE	TT1.54CE	1 1/2"-Tiger		
		PRICE	29.26	53.00		
		TOTAL	58.52	106.00		
	2 e.a	MFG.STK	Flexhaust	Flexhaust		
	Vacuum Hose 1 1/2 inches 8 feet assembly PVC w/end cuffs, SAWS #13178	MFG.HOSE	TT1.58CE	1 1/2" -Tiger		
	(Note: Vacuum hoses are used at Dos Rios for skimming in the sand filters)					
	TOTAL GROUP L	TOTAL	89.20	159.96		
M.	SUCTION HOSES	PRICE	168.13	190.3496		
		TOTAL	1,176.91	1,332.45		
	7 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Goodyear		
	Suction Hose 2 inches layflat 50 feet long w/male & female camlocks, SAWS #13179	MFG.HOSE	SD502EC	ASY-2-FLEX-WSD-C-E-50FT		
		PRICE	242.13	345.3858		
		TOTAL	242.13	345.39		
	1 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Goodyear		
	Suction Hose 3 inches NPT Threaded Ends; 50 feet long black EPDM tube, SAWS #25902	MFG.HOSE	SDS03ST3	ASY-3-FLEX-WSD-3NPT-SOFT		
		PRICE	87.20	101.6098		
		TOTAL	697.60	812.88		
	8 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Goodyear		
	Suction Hose 3 inches NPT Threaded Ends; 15 feet long black EPDM tube punch lok and band-it, SAWS #13184	MFG.HOSE	SD153ST3	ASY-3-FLEX-WSD-3NPT-15FT		
		PRICE	70.77	127.3100		
		TOTAL	4,458.51	8,020.53		
	63 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kanaflex		
	Suction Hose 3 inches w/male female couplings Kanaline 15 ft long, SAWS #33315	MFG.HOSE	SD15W3EC	ASY-KA3-Kanaline-SR-WL375HSA3 -PL-15.00 FT		
		PRICE	169.47	190.3682		
		TOTAL	5,084.10	5,711.05		
	30 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Goodyear		
	Suction Hose 4 Inches w/male & Female camlocks rubber 20 feet long, SAWS #13175	MFG.HOSE	SD204EC	ASY4FLEX-WSD-C-E-BAND		
		PRICE	346.70	448.4541		
		TOTAL	346.70	448.45		
	1 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Goodyear		
	Suction hose 6 Inches w/male & Female camlocks rubber 20 feet long punch lock and band it, SAWS #13174	MFG.HOSE	SD206EC	ASY-6-FLEX-WSD-C-E-20FT		
		PRICE	170.12	192.7662		
		TOTAL	850.60	963.83		
	5 ea.	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kanaflex		
	Hose suction 4 Inches x 20 ft with male and female Kanaline, SAWS #35558	MFG.HOSE	SD	ASY-4-Kanaline-C-E-20FT		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

San Antonio Belting & Pulley
 2111 W. Cevallos
 San Antonio, TX 78204

Austin Distributing
 5344 Rittiman Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78218

River City Hydraulics, Inc.

Taylor Made Hose

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		San Antonio Belting & Pulley 2111 W. Cevallos San Antonio, TX 78204	Austin Distributing 5344 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	River City Hydraulics, Inc.	Taylor Made Hose
	TOTAL GROUP M	TOTAL	12,856.55	17,634.57		
N.	HYDRANT HOSES/MILL HOSE (Working PSI 112)	PRICE	77.98	95.2869	NO BID	NO BID
	1 ea. Hydrant Hose 1 1/2 inches x 50 feet NST thread brass male/swivel female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket, SAWS #25905	TOTAL	77.98	95.29		
		MFG.STK	Dixon	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE	M15-50KAF	M15-50KAF		
	1 ea. Hydrant Hose 2 inches x 50 feet NST thread brass male/swivel female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it, SAWS #25906	PRICE	84.53	103.2947		
		TOTAL	84.53	103.29		
		MFG.STK	Dixon	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE	M20-50 KAS	M20-50 KAS		
	1 ea. Hydrant Hose 2 1/2 inches x 50 feet NST thread brass male/swivel female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it, SAWS #25907	PRICE	118.04	144.2554		
		TOTAL	118.04	144.26		
		MFG.STK	Dixon	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE	M25-50 KAF	M25-50 KAF		
	1 ea. Hydrant hose 3 inches X 50 feet NST Thread Brass Male/Swivel female material poly woven rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it, SAWS #25908	PRICE	131.89	161.1640		
		TOTAL	131.89	161.16		
		MFG.STK	Dixon	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE	M30-50 KAS	M30-50 KAS		
	1 ea. Hydrant hose 4 inches X 50 feet NST Thread brass male/swivel female ploy woven rubber lined single jacket punch lok and band-it, SAWS #25909	PRICE	237.26	230.2141		
		TOTAL	237.26	230.21		
		MFG.STK	Dixon	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE	M40-50 KAS	ASY-4-MILL-FAB400-MA400 50FT		
	TOTAL GROUP N	TOTAL	649.70	734.22		
O.	GARDEN HOSES	PRICE	32.58	31.7773		
	171 ea. Garden Hose 5/8 IN ID 175 PSI 50 ft long male/female 3/4 IN thread, SAWS #13158	TOTAL	5,571.18	5,433.92		
		MFG.STK	Flextech	Flextech		
		MFG.HOSE		CGWH-1050		
	30 ea. Contractor Garden Hose 1 IN 175 PSI rubber w/rugged truck tire core 50 ft long male GHT x female NPT, SAWS #13159	PRICE	84.71	84.3710		
		TOTAL	2,541.30	2,531.13		
		MFG.STK	Flextech	Goodyear		
		MFG.HOSE		ASY-1-Horizon-BC78-50FT		
	30 ea. Connector for garden hose 3/4 IN brass male GHT x male NPT, SAWS #10658	PRICE	3.07	2.8250		
		TOTAL	92.10	84.75		
		MFG.STK	BA776	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE		12GHM-12MP		
	TOTAL GROUP O	TOTAL	8,204.58	8,049.80		
P.	NOZZLES FOR HOSES	PRICE	19.69	24.0522		
	30 ea. Brass Nozzle 3/4" 6 inches long, SAWS #14147	TOTAL	590.70	721.57		
		MFG.STK	Dixon	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE	BN6	BN6		
	TOTAL GROUP P	TOTAL	590.70	721.57		

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Q.	CLEAR VINYL TUBING	PRICE	0.07	0.0829	NO BID	NO BID
	100 foot	TOTAL	7.00	8.29		
	Clear Vinyl Tubing 1/8 In ID, SAWS #16897	MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-02	K010-0204		
	3,000 foot	PRICE	0.12	0.1276		
	Clear Vinyl Tubing 1/4 IN ID & 3/8 OD, SAWS #16893	TOTAL	360.00	382.80		
		MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-04-06	K010-0406		
	18,000 foot	PRICE	0.12	0.1276		
	Clear PVC Vinyl Tubing 1/4 inch ID & 3/8 inch OD, SAWS #16896	TOTAL	2,160.00	2,296.80		
		MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-04-06	K010-0406		
	100 foot	PRICE	0.07	0.0702		
	Clear Poly Tubing 3/16 IN ID 1/4 OD, SAWS #16934	TOTAL	7.00	7.02		
		MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-03-04	K010-0304		
	400 foot	PRICE	0.26	0.2999		
	Clear Vinyl Tubing 3/8 IN & 9.16 IN OD, SAWS #16902	TOTAL	104.00	119.96		
		MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-06-09	K010-0609		
	5,000 foot	PRICE	0.20	0.2361		
	Clear Vinyl Tubing 1/2 IN ID & 5/8 IN OD, SAWS #16900	TOTAL	1,000.00	1,180.50		
		MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-08-10	K010-0810		
	200 foot	PRICE	0.27	0.6503		
	Clear Vinyl Tubing 5/8 IN ID & 3/4 IN OD, SAWS #16898	TOTAL	54.00	130.06		
		MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-10-12	K010-1012		
	3,000 foot	PRICE	0.56	0.6699		
	Clear Vinyl Tubing 3/4 IN ID x 1 IN OD, SAWS #16899	TOTAL	1,680.00	2,009.70		
		MFG.STK	Kuriyama	Kuriyama		
		MFG.HOSE	K010-12-16	K010-1216		
	TOTAL GROUP Q	TOTAL	5,372.00	6,135.13		
R.	BAUER/KANOLINE TYPE FITTINGS	PRICE	21.58	17.7984		
	20 ea.	TOTAL	431.60	355.97		
	Strainer suction hose 3 In RHS35, SAWS #33322	MFG.STK	Dixon	Dixon		
		MFG.HOSE	RHS35	RHS35		
	50 ea.	PRICE	41.96	40.5528		
	Nipple Ball End Style B 3 WLO22BMT3, SAWS #33323	TOTAL	2,098.00	2,027.64		
		MFG.STK	Dixon	Wil-loc		
		MFG.HOSE	MCM3113	WL022BMTB		
	25 ea.	PRICE	15.56			
	3 Inch Female Socket Assembly Galvanized SS for Disc Hose, SAWS #34881	TOTAL	389.00			
		MFG.STK	Dixon			
		MFG.HOSE	FC3103			

San Antonio Belting & Pulley
 2111 W. Cevallos
 San Antonio, TX 78204

Austin Distributing
 5344 Rittiman Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78218

River City Hydraulics, Inc.

Taylor Made Hose

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

San Antonio Belting & Pulley
 211 W. Cevallos
 San Antonio, TX 78204

Austin Distributing
 5344 Rittiman Rd.
 San Antonio, TX 78218

River City Hydraulics, Inc.

Taylor Made Hose

		PRICE	9.15	8.9590		
		TOTAL	54.90	53.75		
	6 ea.	MFG.STK	Dixon	Kanaflex		
	Clamp Hose KA 3 Power Lock 3 IN	MFG.HOSE	SC300	KA3-POW		
		PRICE	32.77	11.0044		
		TOTAL	196.62	66.03		
	6 ea.	MFG.STK	Dixon	Wil-loc		
	Coupling Male Galv Ballstyle B WL260HTM3 3 IN	MFG.HOSE	MC3093	WL260HTM3		
		PRICE	15.56	11.9560		
		TOTAL	93.36	71.74		
	6 ea.	MFG.STK	Dixon	Wil-loc		
	Coupling Female Tail Socket WL270HTF3 3 Inch	MFG.HOSE	FC3103	WL270HTF3		
		PRICE	19.29	18.9588		
		TOTAL	115.74	113.75		
	6 ea.	MFG.STK	Dixon	Wil-loc		
	Lever Locking WL273LR3 3 Inch	MFG.HOSE	LR3043	WL273LR3		
		PRICE	0.98	2.0016		
		TOTAL	19.60	40.03		
	20 ea.	MFG.STK	Dixon	Wil-loc		
	O Ring for 3 Inch Bauer/Kanoline Fittings WL 280OR3	MFG.HOSE	RG3053	WL280OR3		
	TOTAL GROUP R	TOTAL	3,398.82	2,728.91		
	EMERGENCY REQUEST (after hours) (From 5:01 PM to 6:59 AM)	PRICE	50.00	100.00		
	Minimum Charge for after hours	PRICE	None	0.00		
	FOR INSTALLATION OF EACH FITTING ON LENGTH OF HOSE	PRICE	No Charge	0.00		
			*			
	GRAND TOTAL	TOTAL	59,801.84	67,410.57		
	DELIVERY AND SERVICE	DELIVERY DAYS	2 days	3 days		
	Delivery Days	BUSINESS HOURS	8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Mon - Fri.	8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Mon - Fri.		
	Business Hours					

NO BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL

FOR: Annual Contract for Hydraulic Air, Water, Fuel & Industrial Hoses & Fittings

TIME & (February 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., January 29, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			San Antonio Belting & Pulley 211 W. Cevallos San Antonio, TX 78204	Austin Distributing 5344 Rittiman Rd. San Antonio, TX 78218	River City Hydraulics, Inc.	Taylor Made Hose
	EXTENSION 1		59,801.84			
	EXTENSION 2		59,801.84			
	EXTENSION 3		59,801.84			
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days		

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

- San Antonio Belting & Pulley
- Alamo City Hydraulics
- Austin Distributing
- Hydradyne
- Hydraequip
- Hydraulic Supply
- IBT Industrial
- Pirtek
- River City Hydraulics
- Taylor Made Hose
- TLR Hydraulic

- Demandstar
- SAWS Website